RO

|7APR -3 AN & 56
FLOOR AMENDMENT NO. oF REPRESENTATIVES ﬂ/ Wels

Briend C.S.S.B. No. 1 (house committee printing) as follows:

(1) In Article IX of the bill, in Section 17.13,
Appropriations for Selected State Agencies and Programs, in the
Economic Stabilization Fund appropriations to the Higher Education
Coordinating Board for TEXAS Grants (page IX-85), strike
"$87,653,496" and substitute "$163,000,000".

(2) In Article IX of the Dbill, in Section 17.13,
Appropriations for Selected State Agencies and Programs, in the
Economic Stabilization Fund appropriations to the Department of
public Safety for Border Security (page IX-86), strike
"$578,785,177" and substitute "$503,438,673".

(3) Adjust totals and methods of financing accordingly.

Page - 1 -




