Amend Amendment No. 63 by Hinojosa to CSSB 1 (page 120,
prefiled amendments packet) by striking the text of the amendment
and substituting the following:

Amend CSSB 1 (house committee report) as follows:

(1) In Article II of the bill, following the appropriations
to the Department of State Health Services, in Rider 2, Capital
Budget (page II-19), in Subsection c. (1), Vital Records Project
(TxEver), strike "$2,500,000" and substitute "$2,600,000" for the
state fiscal year ending August 31, 2018.

(2) In Article II of the bill, following the appropriations
to the Department of State Health Services (page II-17), add the
following appropriately numbered rider:

Accuracy of Death Certificate of Pregnant Person or
Person Recently Pregnant. It is the intent of the legislature that,
out of funds appropriated above and designated for the Vital
Records Project (TxEver) in Rider 2, Capital Budget (page II-19),
in Subsection c. (1), the Department of State Health Services use
$100,000 for the purpose of developing and implementing an
electronic process for determining in real time whether a person
was pregnant at the time of death or was pregnant at any time in the
year preceding the person's death to ensure the accuracy of that
person's death certificate.

(3) In Article II of the bill, following the appropriations
to the Department of State Health Services, in Rider 23, Unexpended
Balances: Credit Card and Electronic Services Related Fees
(page II-26):

(A) in the first sentence, strike "$3,997,718" and
substitute "$4,097,718"; and

(B) 1in Subsection a., strike "s2,500,000" and
substitute "$2,600,000".

(4) Adjust totals and methods of financing accordingly.



