Amend Amendment No. 330 by Walle to CSSB 1 (page 415 of the

prefiled amendment packet) as follows:

(1) In item (1), strike "$184,660,441" and substitute
"$517,463,959".

(2) In item (2), strike "$16,624,968" and substitute
"$35,900,513".

(3) In item (3), strike "435,009,885" and substitute

"$82,930,822".



