Amend CSHB 1 (house committee printing) as follows:

(1) In Article I of the bill, following the appropriations
to the Comptroller of Public Accounts (page I-20), in Rider No. 13,
between "of" and "legislation", add "HB 269, HB 3015 , or similar".

(2) In Article I of the bill, following the appropriations
to the Employees Retirement System (page I-36), in Rider No. 13:

(A) Dbetween "of" and "legislation", add "HB 1166 or
similar"; and

(B) throughout the rider, strike "surcharge" wherever
it occurs and substitute "fee'".

(3) In Article I of the bill, following the appropriations
to the Facilities Commission (page I-42), in Rider No. 13, strike
"legislation relating to the use of state parking facilities" and
substitute "SB 1068, HB 1607, or similar legislation".

(4) 1In Article I of the bill, in the appropriations to the
Department of Information Resources, in Strategy B.2.1, Data Center
Services (page I-62), amend the funding as follows:

(A) for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2012,
strike "$185,525,223" and substitute "$185,668,233"; and

(B) for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2013,
strike "$169,844,997" and substitute "$169,978,942".

(5) 1In Article I of the bill, following the appropriations
to the Department of Information Resources (page I-65), in Rider
No. 9, in the second paragraph:

(A) strike "$187,739,516" and substitute
"$187,882,526"; and

(B) strike "$172,098,706" and substitute
"$172,232,651".

(6) In Article I of the bill, following the appropriations
to the Veterans Commission (page I-84), in Rider No. 9, in the first
paragraph, strike "and Referral" and substitute "Reporting".

(7) In Article II of the bill, following the appropriations
to the Health and Human Services Commission, in Rider No. 51:

(A) 1in Subsection a. (page II-90), strike "and
Referral" and substitute "Reporting"; and
(B) in Subsection b. (page 1II-91), strike "and

Referral" and substitute "Reporting".

1



(8) In Article IITI of the bill, following the appropriations
to The University of Texas at E1 Paso (page III-59), in Rider No. 2:
(A) 1in the transfer to Texas A&M International
University: Institute for International Trade:
(1) strike "s$193,525" and substitute "$142,241"
for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2012; and
(ii) strike "$193,525" and substitute "$142,241"
for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2013; and
(B) in the transfer to The University of Texas - Pan
American: Center for Entrepreneurship and Economic Development:
(i) strike "$321,001" and substitute "$235,935"
for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2012; and
(ii) strike "$321,001" and substitute "$235,935"
for the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2013.

(9) 1In Article III of the bill, in the appropriations to The
University of Texas - Pan American (page III-59), in the Method of
Financing for Interagency Contracts:

(A) strike "$321,001" and substitute "$235,935" for
the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2012; and

(B) strike "$321,001" and substitute "$235,935" for
the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2013.

(10) In Article III of the bill, in the appropriation to
Texas A&M International University (page III-86), in the Method of
Financing for Interagency Contracts:

(A) strike "S$193,525" and substitute "$142,241" for
the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2012; and

(B) strike "$193,525" and substitute "$142,241" for
the state fiscal year ending August 31, 2013.

(11) In Article III of the bill, in Sec. 28 of the Special
Provisions Relating Only to State Agencies of Higher Education,
General Academic Funding (page III-209), in the first paragraph,
strike "Orange and Lamar State College - Port Arthur," and
substitute "Orange, Lamar State College - Port Arthur, and Lamar
Institute of Technology,".

(12) In Article IV of the bill, following the appropriations
to the Office of Court Administration, Texas Judicial Council (page

IV-24), in Rider No. 3, strike "(35.5 FTEs)" and substitute "(31.5



FTEs)".

(13) In Article VIII of the Dbill, following the
appropriations to the Department of Licensing and Regulation (page
VIII-31), in Rider No. 13, strike "in excess of $77,706,310 (Object
Codes 3035, 3038, 3146, 3147, 3160, 3161, 3164, 3175, 3366, 3727)"
and substitute "in excess of $75,826,310 (Object Codes 3035, 3140,
3147, 3160, 3161, 3164, 3175, 3366, 3727)".

(14) In Article VIII of the Dbill, following the
appropriations to the Texas Board of Nursing (page VIII-37), in
Rider No. 3, strike "(Object Code 3560)" and substitute "(Object
Codes 3560 and 3570)".

(15) In Article VIII of the Dbill, following the
appropriations to the Texas Board of Nursing (page VIII-37), in
Rider No. 4, strike '"continent upon" and substitute "contingent
upon".

(16) In Article IX of the bill, in Sec. 18.02 of the
Contingency and Other Provisions, Interagency Contract to
Coordinate Use of PARIS Data to Assist Veterans and Achieve Savings
for State (page IX-70), strike "and Referral" and substitute
"Reporting".

(17) In Article IX of the bill, in Sec. 18.03 of the
Contingency and Other Provisions, Pension Plan Changes Study (page
IX-70) :

(A) 1in the first sentence of the section strike
"Teachers" and substitute "Teacher"; and
(B) in the second sentence of the section strike

"Teachers" and substitute "Teacher".



