Floor Packet Page No. 94

Amend CSSB 1 (House Committee Printing) as follows:

(1) in Article III, on page III-118, D.1l.1. Strategy: OCR
Priority Plan, by striking "$10,390,625" for Year Ending August 31,
2006 and substituting "$14,715,887" for Year Ending August 31, 2006
and by striking "$10,390,625" for Year Ending August 31, 2007 and
substituting "$14,715,886" for Year Ending August 31, 2007;

(2) in Article VII, on page VII-8, A.1.9. Mass Media
Advertising Contracts, by striking "$33,000,000" for Year Ending
August 31, 2006 and substituting "$28,674,738" for Year Ending
August 31, 2006 and by striking "$33,000,000" for Year Ending
August 31, 2007 and substituting "$28,674,739" for Year Ending
August 31, 2007; and,

(3) in Article XI, on page XI-36, Texas Southern University,

by striking Additional Funding for Office of Civil Rights.



